
Sample Itinerary – 3 Days & 3 Nights 

 

Day 1: Whitehaven Beach 

Your Whitsundays adventure begins as you 
meet the Captain and crew, who warmly 
welcome you aboard with a glass of 
champagne, gourmet canapés, and 
refreshing cold towels. As Oneworld sets sail, 
you’ll be escorted to your luxurious 
stateroom. The journey to Whitehaven Beach 
allows you to relax and soak in the views. 
Once anchored, enjoy the freedom to explore 
the famous white silica sands, sunbathe with 
a cocktail, or dive into thrilling water sports, 
such as kayaking, paddleboarding, or riding a 
seabob. The evening is a serene affair, with a 
three-course dinner crafted by your private 
chef, accompanied by breathtaking ocean views. 

 

Day 2: Whitehaven Beach, Hill Inlet & Luncheon Bay 

Wake up to a sumptuous buffet breakfast 
served on the aft deck, featuring fresh juices, 
hot coffee, and eggs cooked to your liking. 
For a truly unforgettable experience, take to 
the skies with a seaplane tour, offering a 
bird’s-eye view of the Whitsundays, with its 
stunning beaches, lush rainforests, and the 
surrounding Great Barrier Reef Marine Park. 
Upon your return, unwind with sunset 
cocktails, canapés, and a dip in the hot tub 
as Oneworld cruises north to Luncheon Bay. 
Here, you’ll enjoy an alfresco dinner under 
the stars, with the serene backdrop of Hook 
Island’s northernmost point. 

 

  



Day 3: Bait Reef Lagoon, Outer Great Barrier Reef & Stonehaven Bay 

As dawn breaks, you might hear the gentle 
hum of the engines as Oneworld makes her 
way to the Outer Great Barrier Reef. By the 
time you awaken, you’ll find yourself 
surrounded by the serene turquoise waters of 
Bait Reef Lagoon. Spend the day exploring 
the underwater world, where the Stepping 
Stones—a series of coral bommies—create a 
labyrinth of channels and caves teeming with 
marine life, from vibrant tropical fish to 
majestic sea turtles and reef sharks. After a 
day filled with snorkeling, swimming, and 
marine exploration, Oneworld will head back 
to the mainland, anchoring in the sheltered 
waters of Cid Harbour. 

 

Day 4: Cid Harbour & Departure 

On your final morning, wake up to the tranquil 
beauty of Hook Island. Early risers can 
embark on a hike to Whitsunday Peak, a 
challenging two-hour round trip that rewards 
with panoramic views of the islands. For those 
preferring a more relaxed pace, the morning 
can be spent lounging on deck, taking a 
refreshing swim, or indulging in an onboard 
massage. As the day progresses, Oneworld 
will begin her final journey, cruising along the 
eastern side of Whitsunday Island before 
returning to the mainland for guest departure.  

 


